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RE enables pupils to develop an understanding of concepts and themes that underpin religion and human experience. The RE 
taught at Scott Wilkie contributes to spiritual, moral, social and cultural development (SMSC). This makes a significant 
contribution to helping “pupils develop and demonstrate skills and attitudes that will allow them to participate fully in and 
contribute positively to life in modern Britain.” Through practising the skills of tolerance and mutual respect as seen in 
fundamental British values, RE at Scott Wilkie provides opportunities to develop pupils’ learning and understanding around 
people they will meet, work and live alongside.  

There is a yearly ‘Big Question’ and all 6 half-termly topics link up to this. At the start of the year, the yearly ‘Big Question’ 
should be on display and stay for the whole year and the half-termly Question’ should be displayed each half term. Specific key 
vocabulary for the topic should be displayed and referred back to when teaching weekly lessons. The topic vocabulary should 
be relevant to the topic instead of generic vocabulary for that religion. Every RE topic should include one P4C lesson. Real-life 
artefacts should be used when teaching lessons. There should be at least one visit in the year to a place of worship in each 
year group. RE should be taught in a creative way with lots of drama and art. The expectation is that there should be at least 
four pieces of work in the RE books per half term. Each topic is followed by a half termly assessment. 

RE: Whole School Curriculum Map RE is taught weekly for fifty minutes in KS1 and one hour and ten minutes in KS2. Complete 
schemes of work for all units which include knowledge and skills progression in RE, can be found on school’s Google Drive to 
support teacher’s subject knowledge and professional development. Claire Clinton, the Director of Education for England and a 
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Newham RE consultant works alongside the RE co-ordinator and the staff providing support with planning, teaching and 
monitoring.  

 

Below is a diagram showing how Blooms key skills are targeted within the ensuring that there is clear progression in the skills 
taught in RE at Scott Wilkie. 

 

Key Stage one RE tasks in books should focus on knowledge and understanding tasks, ensuring pupils have firm foundations on 
which to build their understanding of religions and world views. In Key Stage two, year 3 & 4 focus on understanding and 
application (what difference does this practice/story make to a believer’s life?) Years 5 & 6 tasks focus on application and 
analysis (looking at what religions and world views share and what makes them distinctive). Years 4, 5 and 6 should 
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understand that within each religion, there are different denominations within a religious group e.g. Sunand Shi’a Muslims or 
Protestant and Orthodox Christians. The pupils should be making comparisons between the different denominations. 
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Aims A and B:  
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Aims C 
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